EQUIPMENT SERVICES DIVISION
901 W. Smith Road

Bellingham, WA 98226-9610
Phone (360) 778-6400

Fax (360) 778-6401

WHATCOM COUNTY
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

Elizabeth Kosa
Director Garre#tReynolds, Superintendent

MEMO TO: County Executive Satpal Singh Sidhu
THROUGH: Brad Bennett, Finance Manager

FROM: Elizabeth Kosa, Public Works Director
Brett Piepel, Public Works Equipment Services Assistant Superintendent

DATE: July 6, 2023

RE: Recommend to Award Bid #23-50 — Rental Rates for Maintenance & Construction Equipment
Without Operator

Background

Bids were duly advertised to establish prices and identify firms that are interested in providing maintenance
and construction equipment for rent to the County on an on-call basis, for the term of August 1, 2023 through
December 31, 2024. Public Works and other departments will select equipment for rent from the list. The
selection will be based on equipment availability and suitability, with preference to the low bidder. Three (3)
companies submitted bids on June 27, 2023. A list of available equipment and labor rates is attached.

e Birch Equipment
e PacWest Machinery
e United Rentals

Requested Action

Public Works requests the County Council and County Executive's approval to award bid #23-50 to all bidders.
Rentals will be made on an as-needed basis. The award for each bidder for the one-year term will not exceed
$100,000.00.

Questions
Please contact Brett Piepel at x6405 if you have any questions or concerns regarding this request.

Recommendation
In accordance with WCC 3.08.030, | concur with this recommendation, and forward such to the County Council and
County Executive for approval, per WCC 3.08.100(A).

7/7/23

Brad Bennett, ASFinance Manger Date

Approved as recommended:

County Executive Date of Council Action



Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 1 - Gravel Dump Trucks

10-Yard 3-Axie Dump Truck

Bidder Information

Description Units Hourly

Daily

Wkly

Mnthly

United Rentals, Inc.
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

No auto tarp

S 552.00

$ 1,374.00

S 3,665.00

12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck

No Bid

18-Yard 5-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer

No Bid

22-Yard 7-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer

No Bid

End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)

No Bid

Group 2 - Rock Dump Trucks

10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck

No Bid

12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck

No Bid

End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)

No Bid

Group 3 - Side Dump Trucks

10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck

No Bid

12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck

No Bid

18-Yard 5-Axie Dump Truck & Pony Trailer

No Bid

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 3 - Side Dump Trucks (continued)

22-Yard 7-Axie Dump Truck & Pony Trailer

No Bid

End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)

No Bid

Group 4 - Lowboy & Pup Trailer

2-Axle Lowboy Trailer

No Bid

3-Axle Lowboy Trailer

No Bid

4-Axle Lowboy Trailer

No Bid

Pup Trailer

No Bid

2-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck

No Bid

3-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck

No Bid

4-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck

No Bid

Group 5 - Semi-Bottom Dump Truck

18-yard Belly Dump 2-Axle Trailer

No Bid

20-yard Belly Dump 3-Axle Trailer

No Bid

20-yard Belly Dump 4-Axle Trailer

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50

Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 6 - Off-Road Dump Truck

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
PacWest Machinery Volvo A30g 31t articulated hauler S 4,300.00 | S 12,900.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Volvo A35 37t articulated hauler S 5,400.00 | $ 16,200.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon Volvo A45 45t articulated hauler S 6,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
Mobilization 165/hour
Group 7 - Front End Loader
2-cubic yard
Bidder Information Description Units| Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC. 2-cubic yard 8 $1,827.00 | S 5,482.00
Phone 206-321-2699 SEE ATTACHMENT FOR ALL OPTIONS
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization $165.00
3-cubic yard
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
Birch Equipment Front End Loader S 795.00|S 2,325.00| S 5,325.00
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies
PacWest Machinery, LLC. 3-cubic yard [ 10 | 1'$ 2,040.00 | $ 6,120.00

206-321-2699
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization $165.00

Phone

SEE ATTACHMENT FOR ALL OPTIONS

United Rentals, inc.

Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

3-cubic yard

|$ 825.00[$2,111.00 [ $ 5,549.00

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)

4-cubic yard
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC. 4-cubic yard 8 $ 2,847.001S 8,925.00
Phone 206-321-2699 SEE ATTACHMENT FOR ALL OPTIONS
Location Kent or Mit Vernon
Mobilization $165.00
United Rentals, Inc. 4-cubic yard [$1,236.00 [ $ 3,086.00 [ $ 7,298.00
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour
5-cubic yard
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC. 5-cubic yard 6 S 3,867.00 | S 11,602.00

Phone 206-321-2699 SEE ATTACHMENT FOR ALL OPTIONS
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization $165.00

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Whatcom County Bid #23-50

Group 8 - Road Grader

Bidder Information

Description

Size

Units

Hourly

Daily

Wkly

Mnthly

PacWest Machinery, LLC.
206-321-2699
Kent or Mt Vernon
165/hour

Phone
Location
Mobilization

Mauldin M-415 Maintainer

3.4 yd’®

2

$ 2,000.00

$ 6,000.00

Group 9 - Dozer

D-3 Dozer

Bidder Information

Description

Rippers

Units

Hourly

Daily

Wkly

Mnthly

Birch Equipment
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multipte

Mobilization Varies

JD450 (17,500)

No

S 570.00

$ 1,425.00

S 3,920.00

United Rentals, inc.
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

JD450K LGP 70hp

No l

[$ 584.00($ 1,621.00|$ 3,913.00

D-6 Dozer

Bidder Information

Description

Rippers

Units

Hourly

Daily

Wkly

Mnthly

Birch Equipment
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies

JD650 (22,350)

Yes

S 770.00

$ 2,065.00

S 5,650.00

United Rentals, Inc.
877-874-4468
Bellingham
175/hour

Phone
Location
Mobilization

JD650 110hp

No

|$ 828.00(%2327.00|$ 8,3824.00

D-7 Dozer

No Bid

D-8 Dozer

No Bid

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 10 - Excavator

Bidder Information Description Wl:i‘:ht B:iczk:t Ca::ity Thumb | Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
Birch Equipment JD17 (4,100) B Variety Yes S 210.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 1,650.00
Phone 360-734-5717 JD35 (7,760) Variety Yes S 295.00 | S 1,240.00 | S 2,680.00
Location Multiple JD50 (10,800) Variety Yes S 410.00 | $ 1,430.00 | $ 3,150.00
Mobilization Varies JD85 (19,250) Variety Yes S 510.00{S$ 1,795.00|S$ 4,235.00
JD135 (32,000) Variety Yes S 695.00 | $ 2,085.00 | $ 5,295.00
JD160 (39,000) Variety Yes S 795.00 | $ 2,285.00 | $ 5,920.00
D245 (57,000) Variety Yes $  1,09500|% 2,995.00(% 7,995.00
JD350 (78,000) Variety Yes S 1,480.00 [ $ 4,125.00 ( $ 11,595.00
PacWaest Machinery, LLC. Volvo EC140, 31660# 24"-60" 208404 |Yes 6 $ 1,83000[$ 5,820.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Volvo ECR145, 33950# 24"-60" 19370# |Yes 6 $ 1,955.00|$ 5,865.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon Volvo EC160, 39390# 24"-60" 300404 |Yes 6 S 2,12500|S$ 6,375.00
Mobilization 165/hour Volvo EC220, 49490# 42"-66" 34600# |Yes 6 S 260000|S 7,777.00
Volvo ECR235, 55780# 42"-66" 36850# |Yes 5 S 2,680.00|S$ 8,032.00
Voolvo EC300, 68330 48"-66" 45320# |Yes 5 S 3,315.00| $ 9,945.00
Volvo ECR355,76270# 48"-72" 60150# |Yes > S 3,570.00$ 10,710.00
SEE ATTACHMENT FOR MORE OPTIONS
United Rental, Inc. 25k Ib JD 130 Variety Y S 763.00|S 2,019.00 [$S 4,889.00
Phone 877-874-4468 35k b JD 135 Variety Y S 847.00|$ 2,276.00| S 5,521.00
Location Bellingham 50k b JD 210 Variety Y S 983.00|$ 2,611.00|S$S 6,325.00
Mobilization 175/hour 55k Ib JD 245 Variety Y S 1,16200|$ 2,901.00|S$ 7,665.00
70k Ib JD 350 Variety Y $ 1,712.00|$ 4,606.00| S 11,520.00
Group 11 - Mini Excavator
Bidder Information Description Wl:e’i‘;t B::zk:t Ca:af;ty Thumb | Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
United Rentals, Inc Bobcat E35/Equivalent 7500# S 325.00 | $ 869.00 | $ 2,021.00
Phone 877-874-4468 Bobcat E45/Equivalent 10000# S 445001 S 1,296.00 | $§ 2,833.00
Location Bellingham Takeuchi TB290/Equivalent 15000# S 502.00 (S 1,445.00|S 3,372.00

Mobilization 175/hour

PacWest Machinery, LLC.
Phone 206-321-2699
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization 165/hour

SEE ATTACHMENT FOR OPTIONS

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50

Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 12 - Mini Excavator

Bidder Information

Description

Unit Bucket Lift

Thumb | Unit: Hourl Dail
Weight Size Capacity ) b s oy

Wkly

Mnthly

PacWest Machinery, LLC.
Phone 206-321-2699
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization 165/hour

SEE ATTACHMENT FOR OPTIONS

Group

13 Track-Type Ditching Excavator

No Bid

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50

Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 14 - Log Loader with Hydraulic Grapple

No Bid

Group 15 - Scraper

No Bid

Group 16 - Shoulder Spreader

No Bid

Group 17A - Broom, Regenerative Air Sweeper, Vacuum Truck Sweeper, & Self-Propelled Broom

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
Birch Equipment Lay-Mor SM300 $ 215.00|S$ 795.00|$ 1,695.00
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies
PacWest Machinery, LLC. TYMCO 435 regenerative air sweeper 3 $ 2,000.00 | S 6,000.00
Phone 206-321-2699 TYMCO 600 regenerative air sweeper 3 $ 3,100.00 | S 9,000.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon TYMCO 500X regenerative air sweeper $ 3,400.00 | $ 10,300.00

Mobilization 165/hour

United Rentals, inc.
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

Lay-Mor SM300/Eqivalent

[$ 321.00[$ 947.00]$ 2,136.00

Group 17B - Broom, Side Cast with Cab

Bidder Information

Description

Units

Hourly

Daily

Wkly

Mnthly

PacWest Machinery, LLC.
Phone 206-321-2699
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization 165/hour

Broce 350 Cast Off

3

$ 1,147.00

S 3,442.00

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18A - Steel Roller

Bidder Information W:ri‘gltit 3‘::;: Vibrate | Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly

Birch Equipment Bomag 900 2,639%# 35" Yes S 21000|$ 725.00|S 1,950.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Bomag 47" 5,732# | 47" Yes S 275.00|$ 820.00|S 2,455.00
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies

PacWest Machinery, LLC. Volvo DD35 8,510# | 54.1" Yes 3 $ 1,500.00 | $ 4,500.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Volvo DD120 28,008#| 78.7" Yes 3 S 2,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
Location Kent Volvo DD140 31,390#| 55.1" Yes 3 S 3,000.00 | S 9,000.00
Mobilization 165/hour

United Rentals, Inc. Wacker RD12 3,000# 36" S 286.00|S5 868.00|S 1,883.00
Phone 877-874-4468 Hamm H71 14,000#| 66" S 548.00| S 1,487.00 | S 3,580.00
Location Bellingham Hamm H101 23,000#| 84" S 778.00|$ 1,886.00 | $ 4,798.00
Mobilization 175/hour

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Whatcom County Bid #23-50

Group 18B - Pneumatic Roller

Bidder information Description Wl:i‘;\t \7\::;: Units Hourly Daily WKkly Mnthly
Birch Equipment Bomag 66" 15,355#| 66" S 625.00|$ 2,245.00 | $ 4,300.00
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies
PacWest Machinery Volvo PT125 25,000#| 68" 4 $ 2,167.00 | $ 6,502.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Volvo PT240 29,000#| 78" 2 $ 2,210.00 | $ 6,630.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon
Mobilization 165/hour
Group 18C - Sheepsfoot Roller
Bidder Information Description Wl.:eri‘g':'\t C\:::::l: Units Hourly Daily Wkly Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC. Volvo SD45B 10,910#| 54" 6 S 862.001$ 2,677.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Volvo SD75B 15,856#| 74" 6 $ 1,402.00 | $ 4,207.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon |Volvo 1158 22,668#| 84" 6 $ 1,827.00 | S 5,482.00

Mobilization $165

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 19 - Mobile Crane

No Bid

Group 20 - Pile Driver

No Bid

Group 21 - Dragline or Clam

No Bid

Group 22 - Layton Box

No Bid

Group 24 - Self-Loading Ditch Cleaner

No Bid

Group 25 - Hydro-Seeder

No Bid

Group 26 - Backhoe

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly

Birch Equipment 580 Case S 475.00|S 1,295.00 | $ 2,710.00
Phone 360-734-5717 580SL 4x4 Cab S 495.00($ 1,225.00 | $ 2,875.00
Location Mutliple 3CX JCB 4x4 Cab S 550.00{$ 1,525.00 | $ 3,105.00
Mobilization Varies

United Rentals, Inc. Case 580 Ext-A-Hoe | | |'$ 427.00]$ 1,185.00 | $ 2,268.00
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 27 - Tractor Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter

Rotary/Rear Mount

No Bid

Flail/Rear Mount

No Bid

Rotary/Shoulder

No Bid

Flail/Shoulder

No Bid

Rotary/Longarm

No Bid

Flail/Longarm

No Bid

Group 28 - Skid-Steer Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter

No Bid

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 29 - Roadside Mower

No Bid

Group 30 - Walking Leg-Type Heavy Duty Brush Cutter

No Bid

Group 31 - Sewer Jet

No Bid

Group 32 - Water Truck

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
United Rentals, inc. 2000 gallon water truck S 431.00($ 1,337.00($ 2,935.00
Phone 877-874-4468 4000 gallon water truck S 709.001S 2,017.00}S 4,735.00
Location Bellingham 500 gallon water truck S 139.00|S 417.00{S 904.00
Mobilization 175/hour
Group 33 - Dust Retardant Truck
No Bid
Group 34 - Utility Boring Machine
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
Birch Equipment 3" Boring Tool S 250.00|$ 800.00 (S 2,150.00

Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies

Group 35 - Under Bridge Inspection Equipment

No Bid

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 36 - Snow Removal Equipment

Bidder information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
Birch Equipment 317G JD Cab S 29500|S 995.00|S 2,120.00
Phone 360-734-5717
Location Multiple
Mobilization Varies
Group 37 -MAN LIFT
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
Birch Equipment GS1930 Scissors S 11500|S$ 365.00(S 520.00
Phone 360-734-5717 40-45' 4WD Boom (Straight or articulated) S 325.00| S 1,050.00 | S 2,350.00
Location Multiple 60-63' 4WD Boom (Straight or articulated) S 495.00|S 1,515.00 | S 3,450.00
Mobilization Varies Note - Please call for more options
United Rentals, Inc. Genie Z45 4wd/Equivalent S 34500|S 914.00|S 2,018.00
Phone 877-874-4468 Genie 5§65 4wd/Equivalent S 466.00$ 1,185.00 (S 2,867.00
Location Bellingham Genie 5§85 4wd/Equivalent S 784.00|S 2,074.00| S 4,605.00
Mobilization 175/hour Genie $S125 4wd/Equivalent $1,498.00 | $ 4,042.00 ]S 8,865.00
Group 38 - Gas Powered Breaker-Rock Drill
No Bid
Group 39 - Forklift
Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
Birch Equipment Doosan warehouse forklift (5,000) S 175.00|S 495.00{S$ 1,190.00
Phone 360-734-5717 5-19 Reach Forklift (5,000) $ 375.00|$ 1,050.00 | S 1,850.00
Location Multiple GS 1056 Reach Forklift (10,000) S 675.00|5 2,325.00 | $ 4,955.00
Mobilization Varies Note - Please call for more options
United Rentals, Inc. 5k Ib Whse Forklift S 217.00|$ 61500 |S$ 1,305.00
Phone 877-874-4468 8K Ib Reach Forklift S 497.00|S$ 1,389.00 | S 2,992.00
Location Bellingham 10k Ib Reach Forklift S 667.00|S$ 1,683.00|S$ 4,169.00
Mobilization 175/hour Note - Please call for more options

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 40 - Trailer

Bidder Information

Description

GVWR

Len_g}h

Hitch

Units

Hourly

Daily

Weekly

Monthly

Birch Equipment
360-734-5717

Mulitiple
Varies

Phone
Location
Mobilization

Fixed Trailer 14,000 Deckover

14,000

20'

2-5/16"

s

95.00

S 345.00

S 852.00

Great Northern TB20

14,000

20'

2-5/16"

95.00

S 350.00

S 860.00

United Rentals, Inc.
Phone 877-874-4468
Location Bellingham
Mobilization 175/hour

Tilt Felling FT10/Equivalent

[ 10,000 |

18" |2-5/16"|

[s

71.00 | $ 269.00 [ $

589.00

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 41 - Miscellaneous Equipment

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
Birch Equipment Utility Vehicle, 2 passenger |'$ 11500|$ 35000($ 595.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Water Trailer, 500 gallon S 135.00|S 410.00|S  765.00
Location Multiple Dumper TX2500 tracked ride on $ 175.00|S$ 720.00|S$ 1,605.00
Mobilization Varies Conveyor, 10' electric S 90.00|S 295.00|S 690.00
Loader, Dingo TX525 w/platform S 23500|S 805.00|$ 2,140.00
Dump Truck, 7 ton 4.6 yd off highway S 775.00|S$ 1,795.00|$ 5,415.00
Dump Truck, 11 ton 7.6 yd off highway $1,165.00 | $ 2,895.00 | S 7,980.00
Loader,Dozer blade 6-way 84" S 90.00|$ 355.00]|S$ 865.00
PacWest Machinery Atlas Copco Compressor XAS110 10 S 310.00|S 945.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Atlas Copco Compressor XAS188 10 S 490.00|S 945.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon  {Atlas Copco Compressor XAS250 10 S 670.00|$ 1,485.00
Mobilization 165/hour Atlas Copco Compressor XAS440 10 $1,215.00 | $ 2,025.00
Atlas Copco Compressor XAST400 10 $ 1,305.00{ S 3,645.00
Atlas Copco Compressor XAS950 10 $ 3,150.00 | $§ 9,450.00
Atlas Copco Compressor XAS1800 10 S 5,400.00 | S 16,200.00
Volvo Double Drum Roller DD25 8 S 900.00|$ 2,700.00
Volvo Double Drum Roller DD30 4 S 980.00|S$ 2,932.00
Volvo Double Drum Roller DD110 5 S 2,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
Blaw Knox P4410 Paver 2 S 6,000.00 | $ 17,000.00
Blaw Knox Blaw Kontrol Slope & Grade Kit 2 S 800.00|S$ 800.00
FRD Kent HP65 Plate Compactor 4 $ 470.00 | S 1,402.00
FRD Kent HP135 Plate Compactor 4 S 510.00($ 1,530.00
FRD Kent HP210 Plate Compactor 4 S 552.00|$% 1,657.00
Masaba Conveyer Belts diesel 36"x30" 2 S 400.00|S$ 1,150.00
Masaba Conveyer Belts diesel 36"x60" 2 S 550.00|S 1,670.00
Masaba Conveyer Belts diesel 48"x60' 2 S 765.00|S 2,295.00
Mesaba adjustable leg supports 2 S 85.00|S 1,670.00
Masaba Conveyor Belt Hydraulic 36"x40' 2 S 470.00|$ 1,402.00
Atlas Copco Generator QAS25 4 $ 510.00|$ 1,530.00
Atlas Copco Generator QAS45 4 S 637.00(S$ 1,912.00
Atlas Copco Generator QAS70 4 $1,062.00 | $ 3,187.00

2023-2024 Rental Rates
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Whatcom County Bid #23-50
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 41 - Miscellaneous Equipment (continued)

Bidder Information Description Units Hourly Daily Weekly Monthly
PacWest Machinery (continued) Atlas Copco Generator QAS95 4 $1,232.00|$ 3,697.00
Phone 206-321-2699 Atlas Copco Generator QAS125 4 S 1,360.00 | S 4,080.00
Location Kent or Mt Vernon |Atlas Copco Generator QAS150 4 $1,955.00 | $ 5,865.00
Mobilization 165/hour Atlas Copco Generator QAS200 4 $2,252.00|S 6,757.00
Altlas Copco Generator QAS250 2 $2,592.00|S 7,777.00
FRD Kent Hammer F6 Breaker 4 $ 1,020.00 | § 3,060.00
FRD Kent Hammer FX175 4 $1,487.00 | S 4,462.00
FRD Kent Hammer FX275 4 $ 2,380.00 | $ 7,140.00
FRD Kent Hammer HP13001 2 $ 3,952.00 | S 11,857.00
Eco Verse SM720 9.5 yds trommel 2 NA S 17,010.00
Eco Verse SM720K 9.5 yds trommel 2 NA $ 20,115.00
Eco Verse Trommel drums 3 NA S 3,600.00
Eco Verse Inventhor T-6 Shredder 2 NA S 35,100.00
Eco Verse Inventhor T-9 Shredder 2 NA S 42,525.00
United Rentals, Inc. Light Tower-Towewable S 11500|S 281.00]|S 616.00
Phone 877-874-4468 185cfm Compressor $ 207.00|$ 52500]|S 942.00
Location Bellingham Track Skid Steer $ 351.00|$1,056.00 S 2,331.00
Mobilization 175/hour Message Board S 307.00|S 725.00|S$ 1,295.00
Rammer/Jumping Jack S 105.00|$ 31000(S 662.00
Std. Plate Compactor S 102.00|S$ 310.00|S$ 643.00
Note - Please call for additional items
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