



DATE: May 5, 2021
TO: Tyler Schroeder, Director of Administrative Services
FROM: Brad Bennett, AS Finance Manager
SUBJECT: Award of Bid #21-25, Rental of Equipment Without Operator

BACKGROUND

The purpose of this bid is to establish prices and identify firms that are interested in providing maintenance and construction equipment for rent to the County on an on-call basis.

Public Works and other departments will select equipment to rent from the list. The selection will be based on equipment availability and suitability, with preference to the low bidder. The following companies submitted bids on Tuesday, April 20, 2021. A list of available equipment and labor rates is attached.

- Ahern Rentals
- Birch Equipment
- Herc Rentals
- NC Machinery
- PacWest Machinery
- SE Rents
- Star Rentals
- United Rentals

Rentals will be made on an as-needed basis. Administrative Services is requesting approval to award to all bidders. The award for each vendor will not exceed \$100,000.00.

I concur with the recommendation.


AS Finance Manager

Approved as Recommended:

County Executive

Date of Council Action _____

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 1 - Gravel Dump Trucks						
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
United Rentals	<i>No Auto-tarp</i>			\$ 632.00	\$ 1,581.00	\$ 4,871.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour						
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck						
Herc Rentals Inc	<i>With Auto-tarp</i>	42		\$ 660.00	\$ 2,095.00	\$ 4,600.00
Phone 360-355-5018 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$95 each way						
No Bid						
18-Yard 5-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer						
No Bid						
22-Yard 7-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer						
No Bid						
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)						
No Bid						
Group 2 - Rock Dump Trucks						
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck						
No Bid						
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck						
No Bid						
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)						
No Bid						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 3 - Side Dump Trucks	
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck	No Bid
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck	No Bid
18-Yard 5-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer	No Bid
22-Yard 7-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer	No Bid
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)	No Bid

Group 4 - Lowboy & Pup Trailer	
2-Axle Lowboy Trailer	No Bid
3-Axle Lowboy Trailer	No Bid
4-Axle Lowboy Trailer	No Bid
Pup Trailer	No Bid
2-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	No Bid
3-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	No Bid
4-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	No Bid

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 5 - Semi-Bottom Dump Truck
18-yard Belly Dump 2-Axle Trailer
No Bid
20-yard Belly Dump 3-Axle Trailer
No Bid

Group 6 - Off-Road Dump Truck						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NC Machinery Company	730 ADT* 30T No Auto-tarp			\$ 1,850.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 16,500.00
Phone 425-251-5800	740/745 ADT* 45T No Auto-tarp			\$ 2,300.00	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 20,500.00
Location Mount Vernon	*ADT=Articulated Dump Truck					
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Group 7 - Front End Loader						
1-cubic yard						
No Bid						
1.5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment				\$ 365.00	\$ 1,190.00	\$ 3,485.00
Phone 360-734-5717						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$150 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
2-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc		2		\$ 440.00	\$ 1,450.00	\$ 4,200.00
Phone 916-622-5669						
Location Arlington						
Mobilization \$200.00						
NC Machinery Company	CAT 926M	9		\$ 625.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 4,180.00
Phone 425-251-5800						
Location Mount Vernon						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
PacWest Machinery, LLC		4			\$ 1,530.00	\$ 4,590.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$165 per hour						
SE Rents LLC		2	\$ 40.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 1,280.00	\$ 3,840.00
Phone 360-305-2342						
Location Lynden						
Mobilization \$85 per hour						
Star Rentals		4		\$ 460.00	\$ 1,572.50	\$ 2,800.00
Phone 360-255-2020						
Location Ferndale						
Mobilization \$0						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
3-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc		4		\$ 715.00	\$ 2,040.00	\$ 4,995.00
Phone 916-622-5669						
Location Arlington						
Mobilization \$200.00						
Birch Equipment				\$ 475.00	\$ 1,475.00	\$ 4,425.00
Phone 360-734-5717						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$150 per hour						
Herc Rentals Inc		17		\$ 645.00	\$ 1,650.00	\$ 4,800.00
Phone 360-355-5018						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$95 each way						
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT 930M</i>	13		\$ 635.00	\$ 1,570.00	\$ 4,710.00
Phone 425-251-5800						
Location Mount Vernon						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
PacWest Machinery, LLC		6			\$ 1,672.00	\$ 5,015.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$165 per hour						
United Rentals		8		\$ 587.00	\$ 1,842.00	\$ 4,602.00
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
3.5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC		5			\$ 1,870.00	\$ 5,610.00
Phone	206-762-5933					
Location	Kent					
Mobilization	\$165 per hour					
4-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc		1		\$ 770.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 5,800.00
Phone	916-622-5669					
Location	Arlington					
Mobilization	\$200.00					
Herc Rentals Inc		10		\$ 775.00	\$ 1,960.00	\$ 7,000.00
Phone	360-355-5018					
Location	Bellingham					
Mobilization	\$95 each way					
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT 938M</i>	6		\$ 660.00	\$ 1,685.00	\$ 5,025.00
Phone	425-251-5800					
Location	Mount Vernon					
Mobilization	\$125 per hour					
PacWest Machinery, LLC		6			\$ 2,352.00	\$ 7,055.00
Phone	206-762-5933					
Location	Kent					
Mobilization	\$165 per hour					
United Rentals		1		\$ 703.00	\$ 2,692.00	\$ 6,550.00
Phone	360-647-7800					
Location	Bellingham					
Mobilization	\$125 per hour					

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NC Machinery Company	CAT950M	8		\$ 705.00	\$ 1,850.00	\$ 5,550.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour						
PacWest Machinery, LLC		5			\$ 2,635.00	\$ 7,905.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$165 per hour						
6.25-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NC Machinery Company	CAT966M	2		\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 13,500.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour						
7-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NC Machinery Company	CAT972M	1		\$ 1,600.00	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 14,500.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 8 - Road Grader							
Bidder Information	Description	Size	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT 12M/140M Tandem</i>	36,000	0/1		\$ 650.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 5,700.00
Phone 425-251-5800	<i>CAT 12M/140M AWD</i>	36,000	2/4		\$ 800.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 7,200.00
Location Mount Vernon	<i>CAT 160M Tandem</i>	46,000	2		\$ 800.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 7,100.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>CAT 160M AWD</i>	48,000	3		\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,700.00	\$ 11,000.00
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Mauldin M413</i>	3.4 cy	2			\$ 1,958.00	\$ 5,875.00
Phone 206-762-5933							
Location Kent							
Mobilization \$165 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 9 - Dozer							
D-3 Dozer							
Bidder Information	Description	Rippers	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>John Deere 550K; 19,000 lb</i>	Yes	5		\$ 500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,950.00
Phone 916-622-5669 Location Arlington Mobilization \$200.00							
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>JD450; 17,000 LB</i>	No	N/A		\$ 325.00	\$ 990.00	\$ 2,990.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$150 per hour							
Herc Rentals Inc	<i>John Deere 450K</i>		1		\$ 563.00	\$ 1,435.00	\$ 3,380.00
Phone 360-355-5018 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$95 each way							
NC Machinery Company	<i>D3K XL/ D3K LGP 18,000 lb</i>	Yes	4		\$ 425.00	\$ 1,275.00	\$ 3,640.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour							
United Rentals	<i>John Deere 450K</i>	No			\$ 410.00	\$ 1,368.00	\$ 3,960.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour							
D-5 Dozer							
No Bid							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 9 - Dozer (continued)							
D-6 Dozer							
Bidder Information	Description	Rippers	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>John Deere 700K; 32,585 lb</i>	Yes	4		\$ 700.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 6,700.00
Phone 916-622-5669							
Location Arlington							
Mobilization \$200.00							
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>JD650; 18,400 ob</i>	Yes	N/A		\$ 495.00	\$ 1,495.00	\$ 4,490.00
Phone 360-734-5717							
Location Bellingham							
Mobilization \$150 per hour							
Herc Rentals Inc	<i>John Deere 550K</i>		1		\$ 625.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 3,845.00
Phone 360-355-5018							
Location Bellingham							
Mobilization \$95 each way							
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT D6K XL/ D6K LGP 30,000 lb</i>	Yes	6		\$ 650.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 6,200.00
Phone 425-251-5800	<i>CAT D6/D6T; D6/D6T LGP 48,000 lb</i>	Yes	4		\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 13,500.00
Location Mount Vernon							
Mobilization \$125 per hour							
United Rentals	<i>John Deere 650K</i>	Yes	2		\$ 831.00	\$ 2,987.00	\$ 8,679.00
Phone 360-647-7800							
Location Bellingham							
Mobilization \$125 per hour							
D-7 Dozer							
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT D7E 45,000 lb</i>	Yes	3		\$ 1,835.00	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 16,500.00
Phone 425-251-5800							
Location Mount Vernon							
Mobilization \$125 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 9 - Dozer (continued)							
D-8 Dozer							
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT D8T 87,600 lb</i>	Yes	5		\$ 2,750.00	\$ 8,200.00	\$ 24,500.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 10, 11, 12, 13 - Excavator											
Bidder Information	Group #	Description	Unit Weight	Bucket Size	Lift Capacity	Thumb	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	10	John Deere 130G	29,260	24"-60"	7,750	Yes	7		\$ 530.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,150.00
Phone 916-622-5669		Hitachi 160LC, John Deere 160GLC	38,000	24"-60"	9,411	Yes	1		\$ 540.00	\$ 1,705.00	\$ 4,400.00
Location Arlington		John Deere 210G	48,000	24"-60"	13,050	Yes	4		\$ 600.00	\$ 1,980.00	\$ 5,170.00
Mobilization \$200.00		XCMG XE210CU	47,200	36"-60"	13,050	Yes	5		\$ 645.00	\$ 2,120.00	\$ 5,550.00
		XCMG XE210CU	47,200	36"-60"	13,050	Yes	5		\$ 680.00	\$ 2,260.00	\$ 5,845.00
		XCMG XE360U	81,000	36"-60"	35,000	Yes	3		\$ 980.00	\$ 3,280.00	\$ 8,575.00
	11	Kubota KX040, Kubota KX121	9,000		4,250		5		\$ 315.00	\$ 920.00	\$ 2,195.00
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	10	JD17	4,100	9, 12, 16		Yes			\$ 195.00	\$ 670.00	\$ 1,750.00
Phone 360-734-5717		JD35	7,760	12, 24, 42 clean		Yes			\$ 275.00	\$ 890.00	\$ 2,520.00
Location Bellingham		JD50	10,800	12, 24, 48 clean		Yes			\$ 350.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,290.00
Mobilization \$100-150 per hour		JD85	19,250	24 tooth, 48 clean		Yes			\$ 400.00	\$ 1,380.00	\$ 4,190.00
		JD135	32,000	36 tooth, 60 clean		Yes			\$ 550.00	\$ 1,690.00	\$ 4,790.00
		JD160	39,000	36 tooth, 60 clean		Yes			\$ 690.00	\$ 2,275.00	\$ 5,850.00
		JD245	57,000	42 tooth, 66 clean		Yes			\$ 790.00	\$ 2,395.00	\$ 7,299.00
	JD350	78,000	48 tooth, 72 clean		Yes			\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,700.00	\$ 11,100.00	
Herc Rentals	10	Volvo ECR235EL Reduced Tail	60,000				20		\$ 1,126.00	\$ 2,780.00	\$ 6,800.00
Phone 360-355-5018		Komatsu PC210LC STD Reach	50,000				6		\$ 810.00	\$ 1,960.00	\$ 5,500.00
Location Bellingham		Volvo ECR145EL Reduced Tail Rubber Track	38,000				17		\$ 725.00	\$ 1,850.00	\$ 5,200.00
Mobilization \$95 each way		John Deere 125D Reduced Tail Steel Track	38,000				8		\$ 650.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 4,900.00
		Volvo ECR88D Cabbed Rubber Track	19,000				44		\$ 450.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 2,900.00
		Bobcat E50 ROPS Rubber Track	12,000				60		\$ 300.00	\$ 840.00	\$ 2,150.00
	Bobcat E35 ROPS Rubber Track	9,000				117		\$ 270.00	\$ 735.00	\$ 1,675.00	
NC Machinery Company	10	CAT 303.5	8,200	24"	2,955	Yes	27		\$ 270.00	\$ 875.00	\$ 2,370.00
Phone 425-251-5800		CAT 305	11,450	24"	5,159	Yes	23		\$ 380.00	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 2,985.00
Location Mount Vernon		CAT 307.5	17,900	24"	7,938	Yes	22		\$ 470.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,600.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour		CAT 308	18,600	24"	8,478	Yes	23		\$ 480.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 3,675.00
		CAT 313	30,400	36"		Yes	20		\$ 660.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 5,325.00
		CAT 315	34,000	36"		Yes	11		\$ 775.00	\$ 2,270.00	\$ 5,780.00
		CAT 316	38,800	36"		Yes	8		\$ 795.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 6,375.00
		CAT 320	50,265	42"		Yes	12		\$ 870.00	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 6,960.00
		CAT 325 CR	63,500	48"		Both	7		\$ 1,050.00	\$ 3,100.00	\$ 9,400.00
		CAT 326	58,200	48"		Both	2		\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 9,500.00
		CAT 329/330	68,100	48"		Both	1/0		\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 10,000.00
		CAT 335	84,200	48"		Both	4		\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,800.00	\$ 11,500.00
		CAT 336	82,000	48"		Both	6		\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 12,500.00
	CAT 349	112,400	54"		Both	1		\$ 2,100.00	\$ 6,200.00	\$ 18,500.00	
	11	CAT 304E2	10,844		3,462		27		\$ 295.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 2,400.00

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 10, 11, 12, 13 - Excavator (continued)												
PacWest Machinery, LLC		10	Volvo EC140EL	31,660	24"-60"	20,840	Yes	8			\$ 1,530.00	\$ 4,590.00
Phone	206-762-5933		Volvo ECR145EL	33,950	24"-60"	19,370	Yes	10			\$ 1,615.00	\$ 4,845.00
Location	Kent		Volvo EC160EL	39,390	24"-60"	30,040	Yes	10			\$ 1,728.00	\$ 5,185.00
Mobilization	\$165 per hour		Volvo EC220EL	49,490	42"-66"	34,600	Yes	10			\$ 2,125.00	\$ 6,375.00
			Volvo ECR235EL	55,780	42"-66"	36,850	Yes	6			\$ 2,210.00	\$ 6,630.00
			Volvo EC300EL	68,330	48"-66"	45320	Yes	6			\$ 2,748.00	\$ 8,245.00
			Volvo EC350EL	82,180	48"-72"	60150	Yes	6			\$ 3,400.00	\$ 10,200.00
		Volvo ECR355EL	76,270	48"-66"	46766	Yes	5			\$ 3,867.00	\$ 11,600.00	
SE Rents LLC		10	Kubota KX080	18,000	48"	6,000	Yes	5	\$ 56.00	\$ 380.00	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 4,560.00
Phone	360-305-2342		Kubota KX057	13,000	36"	4,000	Yes	2	\$ 46.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 1,160.00	\$ 3,480.00
Location	Lynden		Kubota KX033	8,000	24"	1,500	Yes	1	\$ 34.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,400.00
Mobilization	\$85 per hour		Kubota U25	5,600	24"	1,000	Yes	1	\$ 30.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 1,980.00
			Kubota KX018	4,000	18"	500	Yes	2	\$ 25.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 520.00	\$ 1,560.00
			Kubota K008	2,000	12"	300	No	1	\$ 24.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 1,260.00
		11	Kubota KX040	10,000		2,000		12	\$ 38.00	\$ 255.00	\$ 1,020.00	\$ 3,060.00
		12	Kubota KX040	10,000		2,000		6	\$ 38.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00
Star Rentals		10	Takeuchi TB216	6,000	multiple		Yes	15		\$ 190.00	\$ 654.50	\$ 1,540.00
Phone	360-255-2020		Takeuchi TB230	6,500	multiple		Yes	15		\$ 218.50	\$ 760.75	\$ 1,750.00
Location	Ferndale		Takeuchi TB240	7,500	multiple		Yes	20		\$ 223.25	\$ 769.25	\$ 1,806.00
Mobilization	\$0		Takeuchi TB260	12,000	multiple		Yes	10		\$ 294.50	\$ 1,007.25	\$ 2,380.00
			Takeuchi TB290	18,000	multiple		Yes	5		\$ 375.25	\$ 1,296.25	\$ 3,080.00
United Rentals		10	Takeuchi TB280	19,000	variety		Yes	9		\$ 413.00	\$ 1,567.00	\$ 4,219.00
Phone	360-647-7800		Case CX130	25,000	variety		Yes	2		\$ 510.00	\$ 1,669.00	\$ 4,012.00
Location	Bellingham		John Deere 135G	35,000	variety		Yes	12		\$ 550.00	\$ 1,869.00	\$ 4,770.00
Mobilization	\$125 per hour		John Deere 210G	45,000	variety		Yes	3		\$ 720.00	\$ 2,113.00	\$ 5,279.00
			John Deere 245G	55,000	variety		Yes	10		\$ 790.00	\$ 2,565.00	\$ 6,325.00
			John Deere 350	70,000	variety		Yes	1		\$ 1,214.00	\$ 3,986.00	\$ 9,955.00
			11	Bobcat E35I	7,500				25+		\$ 258.00	\$ 794.00
			Bobcat E45	10,000				20+		\$ 312.00	\$ 925.00	\$ 2,273.00
			Bobcat E85	18,000						\$ 431.00	\$ 1,678.00	\$ 4,122.00

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 14 - Log Loader with Hydraulic Grapple

No Bid

Group 15 - Scraper

No Bid

Group 16 - Shoulder Spreader

No Bid

Group 17A - Broom, Regenerative Air Sweeper, Vacuum Truck Sweeper, & Self-Propelled Broom

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>LayMor Sweepmaster 300</i>	6		\$ 220.00	\$ 675.00	\$ 1,500.00
Phone 916-622-5669 Location Arlington Mobilization \$200.00						
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>8' LayMor Sweeper</i>			\$ 175.00	\$ 745.00	\$ 1,795.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$100-150 per hour						
Herc Rentals	<i>LayMor SM450-ST Sweeper on 4 Wheel Cabbed</i>	6		\$ 338.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 1,990.00
Phone 360-355-5018 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$95 each way						
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>TYMCO 435 Regen Sweeper</i>	2			\$ 1,700.00	\$ 5,100.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$165 per hour	<i>TYMCO 500X Regen Sweeper</i>	1			\$ 3,000.00	\$ 9,000.00
	<i>TYMCO 600 Regen Sweeper</i>	2			\$ 3,000.00	\$ 9,000.00
United Rental	<i>Lay-Mor SM300</i>	25		\$ 255.00	\$ 765.00	\$ 1,695.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 17B - Broom, Side Cast with Cab

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Broce 350</i>	2			\$ 907.00	\$ 2,800.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$165 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18A - Steel Roller									
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Vibrate	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>Ammann AV26E</i>	6,000	48"	Yes	6		\$ 285.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 2,000.00
Phone 916-622-5669									
Location Arlington									
Mobilization \$200.00									
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Bomag 900</i>	2,639	35"	Yes			\$ 245.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 1,995.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>Bomag 47"</i>	5,732	47"	Yes			\$ 275.00	\$ 820.00	\$ 2,455.00
Location Bellingham									
Mobilization \$100-150 per hour									
Herc Rentals	<i>Volvo SD-100D</i>	22,000	84"		13		\$ 650.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 4,000.00
Phone 360-355-5018	<i>Volvo SD75B</i>	16,000	66"		8		\$ 550.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 3,500.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Volvo DD25BW</i>	6,000	47"		31		\$ 252.00	\$ 615.00	\$ 1,625.00
Mobilization \$95 each way									
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT CB24</i>	5,800	47"	Yes	6		\$ 275.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,300.00
Phone 425-251-5800									
Location Mount Vernon									
Mobilization \$125 per hour									
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo DD30B</i>	7,164	49.2"	Yes	6			\$ 900.00	\$ 2,800.00
Phone 206-762-5933	<i>Volvo DD35B</i>	8,510	54.1"	Yes	6			\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,500.00
Location Kent	<i>Volvo DD110C</i>	24,807	66.9"	Yes	7			\$ 1,890.00	\$ 5,670.00
Mobilization \$165 per hour									
Star Rentals	<i>Bomag 100 SL-5</i>	4,000	35.4"	Yes	2		\$ 199.50	\$ 646.00	\$ 1,526.00
Phone 360-255-2020	<i>Bomag BW124DH-5</i>	6,000	47.2"	Yes	1		\$ 199.50	\$ 646.00	\$ 1,526.00
Location Ferndale									
Mobilization \$0									
United Rentals	<i>Wacker RD12A-90</i>	3,000	36"	Yes	10		\$ 199.00	\$ 732.00	\$ 1,667.00
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>Hamm H7I</i>	14,500	66"	Yes	10		\$ 451.00	\$ 1,622.00	\$ 3,550.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Hamm H10I</i>	22,675	84"	Yes	5		\$ 545.00	\$ 1,722.00	\$ 4,666.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour									

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18B - Pneumatic Roller								
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Bomag 66"</i>	15,355	66"			\$ 425.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,820.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$100-150 per hour								
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo PT125</i>	25,000	84"	3			\$ 2,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$165 per hour								

Group 18C - Sheepsfoot Roller								
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>Dynapac CA2500PD</i>	28,889	84"	9		\$ 480.00	\$ 1,675.00	\$ 4,500.00
Phone 916-622-5669 Location Arlington Mobilization \$200.00								
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Bomag 33.5</i>	3,495	33.5"			\$ 245.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 1,995.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$100 per hour								
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT CP56</i>	25,800	84"	4		\$ 650.00	\$ 1,885.00	\$ 5,470.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour								
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo SD45B</i>	10,600	54"	5			\$ 850.00	\$ 2,550.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$165 per hour	<i>Volvo SD75B</i>	15,856	66"	6			\$ 1,340.00	\$ 4,000.00
	<i>Volvo SD115B</i>	25,615	84"	8			\$ 1,860.00	\$ 5,600.00

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18C - Sheepsfoot Roller (Continued)									
Star Rentals		<i>Bomag 124DH-5</i>	6,000	47.2"	1		\$ 199.50	\$ 646.00	\$ 1,526.00
Phone	360-255-2020								
Location	Ferndale								
Mobilization	\$0								
United Rentals		<i>Hamm H7I</i>	15,000	66"			\$ 451.00	\$ 1,622.00	\$ 3,550.00
Phone	360-647-7800	<i>Hamm H10I</i>	23,200	84"			\$ 545.00	\$ 1,722.00	\$ 4,666.00
Location	Bellingham								
Mobilization	\$125 per hour								

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 19 - Mobile Crane							
Bidder Information	Description	Size in tons	Boom Length	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>Manitex 1770C</i>	17	70'		\$ 497.00	\$ 1,989.00	\$ 5,967.00
Phone 916-622-5669	<i>Manitex 2892C</i>	28	92'		\$ 750.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 7,000.00
Location Arlington							
Mobilization \$200.00							
Herc Rentals	<i>Spydercrane URW375 DSL</i>	6680	52'		\$ 846.00	\$ 2,541.00	\$ 7,600.00
Phone 360-355-5018	<i>Spydercrane URW295</i>	6450	37'		\$ 499.00	\$ 1,796.00	\$ 4,800.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Spydercrane URW095S</i>	1990	37'		\$ 499.00	\$ 1,496.00	\$ 4,489.00
Mobilization \$95 each way							

Group 20 - Pile Driver
No Bid

Group 21 - Dragline or Clam
No Bid

Group 22 - Layton Box
No Bid

Group 23 - Pavement Pulverizer
No Bid

Group 24 - Self-Loading Ditch Cleaner
No Bid

Group 25 - Hydro-Seeder
No Bid

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 26 - Backhoe

Bidder Information		Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc		<i>Case 580, John Deere 310 (2WD), John Deere 310 (4WD)</i>	1		\$ 330.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 1,930.00
Phone	916-622-5669	<i>Case 580, John Deere 310 (4WD, Cab)</i>	2		\$ 350.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 2,100.00
Location	Arlington	<i>Case 580, John Deere 310 (E-Stick, 4WD, Cab)</i>	1		\$ 350.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,300.00
Mobilization	\$200.00						
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales		<i>310 John Deere</i>			\$ 210.00	\$ 1,045.00	\$ 2,483.00
Phone	360-734-5717	<i>580 Case</i>			\$ 310.00	\$ 1,090.00	\$ 2,745.00
Location	Bellingham	<i>580SL 4x4 Cab</i>			\$ 320.00	\$ 1,195.00	\$ 2,945.00
Mobilization	\$150 per hour						
Herc Rentals		<i>John Deere 310LEP</i>	24		\$ 298.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 1,950.00
Phone	360-355-5018						
Location	Bellingham						
Mobilization	\$95 each way						
NC Machinery Company		<i>CAT 416 BHL</i>	5		\$ 350.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 2,625.00
Phone	425-251-5800	<i>CAT 420 BHL</i>	4		\$ 450.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,350.00
Location	Mount Vernon						
Mobilization	\$125 per hour						
SE Rents LLC		<i>Kubota B26</i>	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 2,340.00
Phone	360-305-2342	<i>Kubota BX235</i>	1	\$ 21.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 1,980.00
Location	Lynden						
Mobilization	\$85 per hour						
Star Rentals		<i>John Deere 310SL</i>	5		\$ 261.75	\$ 858.50	\$ 2,030.00
Phone	360-255-2020						
Location	Ferndale						
Mobilization	\$0						
United Rentals		<i>Case 580N ext-a-hoe</i>	10		\$ 289.00	\$ 832.00	\$ 2,069.00
Phone	360-647-7800	<i>Case 580N ext-a-hoe w/cab</i>	4		\$ 352.00	\$ 1,222.00	\$ 2,629.00
Location	Bellingham						
Mobilization	\$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 27 - Tractor Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter							
Rotary/Rear Mount							
Bidder Information	Description	Reach Length	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
SE Rents LLC	<i>Land Pride RCR1872</i>	6'	2	\$ 16.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 440.00	\$ 1,320.00
Phone 360-305-2342 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour							
Flail/Rear Mount							
No Bid							
Rotary/Shoulder							
No Bid							
Flail/Shoulder							
No Bid							
Rotary/Longarm							
No Bid							
Flail/Longarm							
No Bid							

Group 28 - Skid-Steer Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter							
Bidder Information	Description	Reach Length	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Herc Rentals	<i>Bradco 30372A Skidsteer w/ 72sf Brushcutter</i>		26		\$ 185.00	\$ 527.00	\$ 1,100.00
Phone 360-355-5018 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$95 each way							
NC Machinery Company	<i>CAT 259D w/ BR172 Brushcutter</i>		13		\$ 380.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,000.00
Phone 425-251-5800 Location Mount Vernon Mobilization \$125 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 28 - Skid-Steer Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter (Continued)							
SE Rents LLC	<i>Land Pride AP-SC7072</i>	6'	2	\$ 85.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00
Phone 360-305-2342							
Location Lynden							
Mobilization \$85 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 29 - Roadside Mower

No Bid

Group 30 - Walking Leg-Type Heavy Duty Brush Cutter

No Bid

Group 31 - Sewer Jet

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Herc Rentals	<i>Shark SJDDG3011 (gas)</i>	1		\$ 113.00	\$ 304.00	\$ 575.00
Phone 360-355-5018	<i>General JM-1450-A (electric)</i>	8		\$ 77.00	\$ 272.00	\$ 500.00
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$95 each way						

Group 32 - Water Truck

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>2,000 Gallon Water Truck</i>	2		\$ 335.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 2,500.00
Phone 916-622-5669						
Location Arlington						
Mobilization \$200.00						
Herc Rentals	<i>4,000 Gallon Truck Freightliner M2-106</i>	27		\$ 565.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 4,200.00
Phone 360-355-5018	<i>2,000 Gallon Truck Freightliner M2-106</i>	79		\$ 450.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 2,600.00
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$95 each way						
NC Machinery Company	<i>2,000 Gallon Truck Freightliner</i>	9		\$ 400.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,600.00
Phone 425-251-5800	<i>4,000 Gallon Truck Valew</i>	2		\$ 800.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 6,900.00
Location Mount Vernon						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
Star Rentals	<i>2,500 Gallon Ford F750 Truck</i>	1		\$ 308.75	\$ 1,105.00	\$ 2,275.00
Phone 360-255-2020	<i>3,750 Gallon International Truck</i>	1		\$ 403.75	\$ 1,445.00	\$ 3,570.00
Location Ferndale						
Mobilization \$0						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 32 - Water Truck (Continued)							
United Rentals		<i>2,000 Gallon Water Truck</i>	2		\$ 394.00	\$ 1,463.00	\$ 3,829.00
Phone	360-647-7800	<i>4,000 Gallon Water Truck</i>	4		\$ 590.00	\$ 1,964.00	\$ 4,710.00
Location	Bellingham	<i>500 Gallon Water Trailer</i>	25		\$ 123.00	\$ 370.00	\$ 787.00
Mobilization	\$125 per hour						

Group 33 - Dust Retardant Truck							
Star Rentals		<i>2,500 Gallon Ford F750 Truck</i>	1		\$ 308.75	\$ 1,105.00	\$ 2,275.00
Phone	360-255-2020	<i>3,750 Gallon International Truck</i>	1		\$ 403.75	\$ 1,445.00	\$ 3,570.00
Location	Ferndale						
Mobilization	\$0						

Group 34 - Utility Boring Machine						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>3" Boring tool</i>			\$ 250.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,150.00
Phone	360-734-5717					
Location	Bellingham					
Mobilization						

Group 35 - Under Bridge Inspection Equipment						
No Bid						

Group 36 - Snow Removal Equipment						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Herc Rentals	<i>Skid-Steer/Bobcat 7113767 w/snow pusher</i>	13		\$ 114.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 400.00
Phone	360-355-5018					
Location	Bellingham					
Mobilization	\$95 each way					

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 37 - Man Lift						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	12' Snorkel TM12E, JLG1230ES	100		\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 415.00
Phone 916-622-5669	19' Snorkel S3219E, Skyjack SJIII3219	382		\$ 115.00	\$ 230.00	\$ 330.00
Location Arlington	26' Skyjack SJ6826RT, Genie GS-2668RT	2		\$ 200.00	\$ 445.00	\$ 900.00
Mobilization \$200.00	30' Boom Articulated JLG E300AJ w/JIB	7		\$ 275.00	\$ 690.00	\$ 1,525.00
<i>Note - Please call for more options</i>						
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	19' scissor Genie			\$ 90.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 690.00
Phone 360-734-5717	26' scissor Genie			\$ 110.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 795.00
Location Bellingham	45' Boom Genie, 500 lb			\$ 275.00	\$ 970.00	\$ 2,395.00
Mobilization \$100-150 per hour	60' Boom Genie, 500 lb			\$ 390.00	\$ 1,320.00	\$ 3,520.00
	80' Boom Genie, 500 lb			\$ 725.00	\$ 2,495.00	\$ 6,890.00
Herc Rentals	Genie S-135 Straight Boom 135' 4WD JIB	12		\$ 1,470.00	\$ 3,920.00	\$ 7,500.00
Phone 360-355-5018	Genie S-85 Straight Boom 85' 4WD JIB	47		\$ 771.00	\$ 1,745.00	\$ 3,600.00
Location Bellingham	Genie S-65 Straight Boom 65' 4WD JIB	97		\$ 400.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 2,200.00
Mobilization \$95 each way	Genie S-45 Straight Boom 45' 4WD JIB	86		\$ 305.00	\$ 645.00	\$ 1,575.00
NC Machinery Company	Genie 1930 Electric Scissor Lift	42		\$ 100.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 425.00
Phone 425-251-5800	Genie S-45 4x4 Manlift	12		\$ 300.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,800.00
Location Mount Vernon	Genie S-65 4x4 Manlift	23		\$ 450.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 2,300.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour	Genie S-85 4x4 Manlift	10		\$ 680.00	\$ 1,900.00	\$ 4,100.00
Star Rentals	Genie 2-45	40		\$ 213.75	\$ 731.00	\$ 1,435.00
Phone 360-255-2020	Genie 5-40	50		\$ 242.25	\$ 820.25	\$ 1,610.00
Location Ferndale						
Mobilization \$0						
United Rentals	40-45' 4WD Boom (straight or articulated)	50+		\$ 301.00	\$ 752.00	\$ 1,879.00
Phone 360-647-7800	60-65' 4WD Boom (straight or articulated)	50+		\$ 419.00	\$ 1,078.00	\$ 2,610.00
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>Note - Please call for more options</i>					
Group 38 - Gas Powered Breaker-Rock Drill						
No Bid						

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 39 - Forklift						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>Hyster H50, Yale GP050, 3,600-5,000 lb, 15'7"</i>	42		\$ 165.00	\$ 475.00	\$ 960.00
Phone 916-622-5669	<i>Genie GTH5519, 5,000-5,500 lb, 19'</i>	13		\$ 320.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,800.00
Location Arlington	<i>Xtreme XR1045, Xtreme XR1147, 10-11,000 lb</i>	2		\$ 400.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 2,875.00
Mobilization \$200.00	<i>Xtreme XR1267, Xtreme XR1270, 12,000 lb</i>	1		\$ 1,020.00	\$ 5,495.00	\$ 12,380.00
<i>Note - Please call for more options</i>						
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>R5519, 5,000 lb Reach (5k)</i>			\$ 175.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,650.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>6,000 lb reach (6K)</i>			\$ 175.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,650.00
Location Bellingham	<i>8,000 lb reach (844)</i>			\$ 285.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 2,190.00
Mobilization \$100-150 per hour	<i>10,000 lb reach (1056)</i>			\$ 575.00	\$ 1,845.00	\$ 5,190.00
Herc Rentals	<i>Toyota 8FGU25 Warehouse Forklift 5,000 lb</i>	381		\$ 154.00	\$ 415.00	\$ 1,000.00
Phone 360-355-5018	<i>Toyota 8FG45U Warehouse Forklift 10,000 lb</i>	8		\$ 285.00	\$ 715.00	\$ 1,850.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Doosan D110S Warehouse Forklift 26,000 lb</i>	1		\$ 945.00	\$ 2,380.00	\$ 5,500.00
Mobilization \$95 each way	<i>Genie GTH5519 Reach Forklift 5,500 lb, 20'</i>	188		\$ 295.00	\$ 770.00	\$ 1,725.00
NC Machinery Company	<i>Skytrack 8042 8,000 lb</i>	6		\$ 300.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 2,375.00
Phone 425-251-5800	<i>CAT TL943D 9,000 lb</i>	6		\$ 375.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 2,500.00
Location Mount Vernon	<i>CAT TL1055D 10,000 lb</i>	12		\$ 500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,400.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>CAT TL1255D 12,000 lb</i>	14		\$ 625.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 3,825.00
SE Rents LLC	<i>JCB 525-60A 10,000 lb 20'</i>	2	\$ 34.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00
Phone 360-305-2342						
Location Lynden						
Mobilization \$85 per hour						
Star Rentals	<i>DooSan 5,000 lb Warehouse Forklift</i>	50		\$ 123.50	\$ 412.25	\$ 889.00
Phone 360-255-2020	<i>Gehl RS-5-19 telescopic, rough terrain 5,000 lb</i>	20		\$ 152.00	\$ 510.00	\$ 1,092.00
Location Ferndale	<i>Gehl RS-6-42 telescopic, rough terrain</i>	15		\$ 270.75	\$ 926.50	\$ 1,820.00
Mobilization \$0						
United Rentals	<i>5,000 lb Warehouse Forklift</i>	50+		\$ 182.00	\$ 510.00	\$ 1,104.00
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>5,000 lb Reach Forklift</i>	50+		\$ 325.00	\$ 813.00	\$ 1,812.00
Location Bellingham	<i>8,000 lb Reach Forklift</i>	50+		\$ 429.00	\$ 1,072.00	\$ 2,275.00
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>Note - Please call for more options</i>					

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 40 - Trailer									
Bidder Information	Description	GVWR	Length	Hitch	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc	<i>Tilt</i>	9,900	16'	2 -5/16"	6		\$ 110.00	\$ 335.00	\$ 765.00
Phone 916-622-5669 Location Arlington Mobilization \$200.00									
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Tilt</i>	14,000	20'	2 -5/16"			\$ 85.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 695.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization									
SE Rents LLC	<i>Tilt</i>	15,000	20'	2-5/16"	2	\$ 22.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 4,020.00
Phone 360-305-2342 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour									
United Rentals	<i>Tilt</i>	10,000	18'	2-5/16"	10		\$ 79.00	\$ 297.00	\$ 893.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour									

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 41 - Miscellaneous Equipment							
Bidder Information		Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Ahern Rentals Inc		<i>Bobcat S70, Mustang 2012 Skidster 600-700 lb, 1/5 YD</i>	1		\$ 225.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 1,495.00
Phone	916-622-5669	<i>Generator Multiquip GA6H 6KW</i>	5		\$ 60.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 440.00
Location	Arlington	<i>Generator Multiquip DCA125, Wacker G125, 100KW, 125KVA, Tow</i>	1		\$ 350.00	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 2,250.00
Mobilization	\$200.00	<i>Air Hammer APT Model 160 60 lb</i>	2		\$ 45.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 300.00
		<i>Pallet Jack Hyster W40Z 4,000 lb</i>	5		\$ 105.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 575.00
		<i>Vertical Tower Flood Light Allmand NL5000 1,000W</i>	48		\$ 95.00	\$ 290.00	\$ 625.00
		<i>Welder Lincoln Vantage 300, Lincoln Ranger 305D 300AMP</i>	6		\$ 75.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 475.00
		<i>Water Trailer Wylie EXP500S 500/560 gal</i>	9		\$ 136.00	\$ 395.00	\$ 525.00
		<i>Utility Cart Kubota RTV1140, Cushman 1600XD4 4-Seat</i>	9		\$ 140.00	\$ 420.00	\$ 650.00
		<i>Air Compressor Atlas Copco XAS 185, Ingersoll Rand P185 185CFM</i>	4		\$ 150.00	\$ 450.00	\$ 750.00
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales		<i>Generator, 25 KVA</i>			\$ 125.00	\$ 490.00	\$ 1,190.00
Phone	360-734-5717	<i>Generator, 55 KVA</i>			\$ 160.00	\$ 585.00	\$ 1,285.00
Location	Bellingham	<i>Light stand, 25'</i>			\$ 95.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 395.00
Mobilization		<i>Forklift, Industrial 5K</i>			\$ 150.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 1,190.00
		<i>Forklift, Industrial 8K</i>			\$ 245.00	\$ 845.00	\$ 1,975.00
		<i>Plate Compactor BVP 18/45</i>			\$ 80.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 300.00
		<i>Air Compressor, 185cfm</i>			\$ 120.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 695.00
		<i>Air Compressor, 375cfm</i>			\$ 180.00	\$ 590.00	\$ 1,285.00
Herc Rentals		<i>Genie Z80 Articulating Boom 80' 4WD JIB DSL</i>	31		\$ 736.00	\$ 1,685.00	\$ 3,500.00
Phone	360-355-5018	<i>Genie Z60 Articulating Boom 60' 4WD JIB DSL</i>	35		\$ 380.00	\$ 875.00	\$ 2,150.00
Location	Bellingham	<i>Genie Z45 Articulating Boom 45' 4WD JIB DSL</i>	2		\$ 305.00	\$ 645.00	\$ 1,575.00
Mobilization	\$95 each way	<i>Skytrak 6036 Reach Forklift 6,000 lb ROPS DSL</i>	81		\$ 360.00	\$ 850.00	\$ 2,150.00
		<i>Genie GTH-1056 Reach Forklift 10,000 lb 56' ROPS DSL</i>	168		\$ 495.00	\$ 1,385.00	\$ 3,350.00
		<i>Genie GTH-1256 Reach Forklift 12,000 lb 56' ROPS DSL</i>	63		\$ 625.00	\$ 1,995.00	\$ 4,200.00

Whatcom County Bid #21-25
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 41 - Miscellaneous Equipment (Continued)

NC Machinery Company		<i>CAT CVP110 Plate Compactor</i>	2		\$ 400.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,500.00
Phone	425-251-5800	<i>Rockland Kryptoklaw (330/336)</i>	1		\$ 350.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,150.00
Location	Mount Vernon	<i>Rockland Kryptoklaw (349)</i>	1		\$ 500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,500.00
Mobilization	\$125 per hour	<i>CAT H140 Hammer (326-336)</i>	1		\$ 950.00	\$ 2,900.00	\$ 8,500.00
		<i>CAT 160 Hammer (336-349)</i>	1		\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 11,500.00
		<i>CAT 180 Hammer (349-374)</i>	2		\$ 2,200.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 19,500.00
		<i>CAT MP20 Procescor w/ Shears</i>	1		\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 12,500.00
		<i>Sitech - 3D Trimble for Dozers & Excavators</i>				\$ 1,700.00	\$ 5,000.00
PacWest Machinery, LLC		<i>Yanmar Vi017 excavator 3,900 lb</i>	4			\$ 850.00	\$ 2,550.00
Phone	206-762-5933	<i>Yanmar Vi035 excavator 7,639 lb</i>	6			\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
Location	Kent	<i>Yanmar SV40 excavator 8,990 lb</i>	10			\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,600.00
Mobilization	\$165 per hour	<i>Yanmar Vi050 excavator 11,288 lb</i>	9			\$ 1,350.00	\$ 4,050.00
		<i>Yanmar Vi060 excavator 12,645 lb</i>	3			\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,500.00
United Rentals		<i>Light Tower - towable</i>	70+		\$ 127.00	\$ 310.00	\$ 567.00
Phone	360-647-7800	<i>Air Compressor, 185cfm</i>	70+		\$ 123.00	\$ 315.00	\$ 699.00
Location	Bellingham	<i>Generator, 25kva</i>	40+		\$ 300.00	\$ 502.00	\$ 1,129.00
Mobilization	\$125 per hour	<i>Note - Please call for additional items</i>					