

**WHATCOM COUNTY
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES**

FINANCE/ACCOUNTING
Whatcom County Courthouse
311 Grand Avenue, Suite #503
Bellingham WA 98225-4082
Brad Bennett, Finance Manager

DATE: April 10, 2019
TO: Jack Louws, County Executive
FROM: Brad Bennett, Administrative Services Finance Manager
SUBJECT: Award of Bid #19-15, Rental of Equipment Without Operator

• **BACKGROUND**

The purpose of this bid is to establish prices and identify firms that are interested in providing maintenance and construction equipment for rent to the County on an on-call basis.

Public Works and other departments will select equipment for rent from the list. The selection will be based on equipment availability and suitability, with preference to the low bidder. The following companies submitted bids on Tuesday March 12, 2019. A list of available equipment and labor rates is attached.

- SE Rents LLC
- United Rentals
- PacWest Machinery
- NW Heavy Equipment Repair
- Birch Equipment

Rentals will be made on an as-needed basis. Administrative Services is requesting approval to award to all bidders. The award for each vendor will not exceed \$100,000.00.

I concur with the recommendation.



AS Finance Manager

Approved as Recommended:

County Executive

Date of Council Action _____

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 1 - Gravel Dump Trucks						
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
United Rentals	<i>No Auto-tarp</i>			\$ 636.32	\$ 1,546.21	\$ 3,981.66
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck						
No Bid						
18-Yard 5-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer						
No Bid						
22-Yard 7-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer						
No Bid						
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)						
No Bid						
Group 2 - Rock Dump Trucks						
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck						
No Bid						
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck						
No Bid						
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)						
No Bid						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 3 - Side Dump Trucks	
10-Yard 3-Axle Dump Truck	
No Bid	
12-Yard 4-Axle Dump Truck	
No Bid	
18-Yard 5-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer	
No Bid	
22-Yard 7-Axle Dump Truck & Pony Trailer	
No Bid	
End Dump Tubs (greater than 15 yards)	
No Bid	

Group 4 - Lowboy & Pup Trailer	
2-Axle Lowboy Trailer	
No Bid	
3-Axle Lowboy Trailer	
No Bid	
4-Axle Lowboy Trailer	
No Bid	
Pup Trailer	
No Bid	
2-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	
No Bid	
3-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	
No Bid	
4-Axle Pup Trailer with Truck	
No Bid	

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 5 - Semi-Bottom Dump Truck
18-yard Belly Dump 2-Axle Trailer
No Bid
20-yard Belly Dump 3-Axle Trailer
No Bid

Group 6 - Off-Road Dump Truck
No Bid

Group 7 - Front End Loader						
1-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair		1		\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00	\$ 3,120.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$75 per hour						
1.5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
SE Rents LLC	<i>Kubota R630</i>	1	\$ 30.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,040.00	\$ 3,120.00
Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
2-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC		2			\$ 1,530.00	\$ 4,590.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals		2		\$ 585.96	\$ 1,679.43	\$ 4,545.29
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
3-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales				\$ 475.00	\$ 1,475.00	\$ 4,425.00
Phone 360-734-5717						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$150 per hour						
NW Heavy Equipment Repair		1		\$ 360.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 4,320.00
Phone 360-676-9331						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$110 per hour						
PacWest Machinery, LLC		4			\$ 1,672.00	\$ 5,015.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals		10		\$ 724.11	\$ 1,853.09	\$ 4,870.34
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 7 - Front End Loader (continued)						
3.5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC		4			\$ 1,870.00	\$ 5,610.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
4-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC		3			\$ 2,352.00	\$ 7,055.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals		1		\$ 1,084.59	\$ 2,708.37	\$ 6,404.51
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						
5-cubic yard						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC		3			\$ 2,635	\$ 7,905.00
Phone 206-762-5933						
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals		1		\$ 1,333.27	\$ 3,327.44	\$ 8,309.99
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 8 - Road Grader							
Bidder Information	Description	Size	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Mauldin M413</i>	3.4 cy	2			\$ 1,958.00	\$ 5,875.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$155 per hour							

Group 9 - Dozer							
D-3 Dozer							
Bidder Information	Description	Rippers	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>John Deere 450; 17,000 lb</i>	No	N/A		\$ 325.00	\$ 990.00	\$ 2,990.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$150 per hour							
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>CAT D3GXL; 16,250 lb</i>	No	1		\$ 260.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$110 per hour	<i>JD450J LT; 16,450 lb</i>	Yes	1		\$ 260.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
United Rentals	<i>John Deere 450</i>	No	5		\$ 511.13	\$ 1,339.36	\$ 3,304.43
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour							
D-5 Dozer							
Bidder Information	Description	Rippers	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>CAT D5GLGP; 20,360 lb</i>	No	1		\$ 375.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,500.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$110 per hour	<i>JD650J LT; 20,500 lb</i>	Yes	1		\$ 328.00	\$ 1,280.00	\$ 3,600.00

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 9 - Dozer (continued)							
D-6 Dozer							
Bidder Information	Description	Rippers	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>John Deere 650; 18,400 lb</i>	Yes	N/A		\$ 495.00	\$ 1,495.00	\$ 4,490.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$150 per hour							
United Rentals	<i>John Deere 650</i>	Yes	3		\$ 876.00	\$ 2,484.00	\$ 7,702.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour							
D-7 Dozer							
No Bid							
D-8 Dozer							
No Bid							

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 10, 11, 12, 13 - Excavator											
Bidder Information	Group #	Description	Unit Weight	Bucket Size	Lift Capacity	Thumb	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	10	<i>JD 17</i>	4,100	9, 12, 16		Yes	N/A		\$ 195.00	\$ 670.00	\$ 1,750.00
Phone 360-734-5717		<i>JD 35</i>	7,800	12, 24, 42 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 275.00	\$ 890.00	\$ 2,520.00
Location Bellingham		<i>JD 50</i>	10,800	12, 24, 48 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 350.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,290.00
Mobilization \$150 per hour		<i>JD 85</i>	19,250	24 tooth, 48 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 400.00	\$ 1,380.00	\$ 4,190.00
		<i>JD 135</i>	32,000	36 tooth, 60 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 550.00	\$ 1,690.00	\$ 4,790.00
		<i>JD 160</i>	39,000	36 tooth, 60 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 690.00	\$ 2,275.00	\$ 5,850.00
		<i>JD 245</i>	57,000	42 tooth, 66 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 790.00	\$ 2,395.00	\$ 7,299.00
		<i>JD 350</i>	78,000	48 tooth, 72 clean		Yes	N/A		\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,700.00	\$ 11,100.00
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	10	<i>Kubota KX057-4</i>	12,200	12, 24, 48" c/o		Yes	2		\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
Phone 360-676-9331		<i>Kubota KX040-4</i>	9,500	12, 24, 36" c/o		Yes	5		\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 2,280.00
Location Bellingham		<i>Kubota U17</i>	3,700	9, 12, 16, 24" c/o		No	2		\$ 153.00	\$ 612.00	\$ 1,536.00
Mobilization Kubota: \$75 or \$110 per hour (KX057)		<i>Hitachi ZX330</i>	80,000	54, 72" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 765.00	\$ 3,060.00	\$ 8,500.00
		<i>Hitachi ZX245-6</i>	64,000	42, 66" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 675.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 6,500.00
		<i>Hitachi ZX200</i>	50,000	42, 60" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 488.00	\$ 1,950.00	\$ 5,800.00
		<i>Hitachi ZX160</i>	38,000	36, 60" c/o		Yes	2		\$ 400.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4,000.00
		<i>Hitachi ZX135</i>	31,000	36, 60" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 375.00	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 3,200.00
		<i>Hitachi ZX120</i>	29,000	24, 36, 60" c/o		Yes	2		\$ 361.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,100.00
		<i>CAT 308E2 w/ Blade</i>	19,000	24, 48" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 280.00	\$ 1,120.00	\$ 2,750.00
Hitachi \$110 per hour + pilot cars and permits	11	<i>Hitachi ZX70 w/ Blade</i>	17,000	24, 48" c/o		Yes	1		\$ 280.00	\$ 1,120.00	\$ 2,750.00
		<i>Kubota KX057-4</i>	12,200				2		\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
		<i>Kubota KX040-4</i>	9,500				5		\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 2,280.00
	<i>Kubota U17 (No Angle Blade)</i>	3,700				2		\$ 153.00	\$ 612.00	\$ 1,536.00	

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 10, 11, 12, 13 - Excavator (continued)												
Bidder Information	Group #	Description	Unit Weight	Bucket Size	Lift Capacity	Thumb	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly	
PacWest Machinery, LLC Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$155 per hour ** pilot cars and permits	10	Volvo EC140EL	31,660	24"-60"	20,840	Yes	4			\$ 1,530.00	\$ 4,590.00	
		Volvo ECR145EL	33,950	24"-60"	19,370	Yes	4			\$ 1,615.00	\$ 4,845.00	
		Volvo EC160EL	39,390	24"-60"	30,040	Yes	5			\$ 1,728.00	\$ 5,185.00	
		Volvo EC220EL*	49,490	42"-66"	34,600	Yes	3			\$ 2,125.00	\$ 6,375.00	
		Volvo ECR235EL*	55,780	42"-66"	36,850	Yes	3			\$ 2,210.00	\$ 6,630.00	
		Volvo EC300EL*	68,330	48"-66"	45,320	Yes	3			\$ 2,748.00	\$ 8,245.00	
		Volvo EC350EL*	82,180	48"-72"	60,150	Yes	4			\$ 3,400.00	\$ 10,200.00	
		Volvo EC380	87,640	Varies	35,560	Yes	1				\$ 11,730.00	
		Volvo EC480	107,640	Varies	40,370	Yes	2				\$ 13,260.00	
SE Rents LLC Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour	10	Kubota KX080-4	18,000	16", 35", 53"	6,500	Yes	2	\$ 50.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 1,600.00	\$ 4,800.00	
		Kubota KX057-4	13,000	12", 24", 48"	3,410	Yes	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00	
		Kubota KX040-4	10,200	12", 18", 24", 36"	4,080	Yes	2	\$ 35.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 1,180.00	\$ 3,540.00	
		Kubota KX040-4	9,600	12", 18", 24", 36"	4,080	Yes	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00	
		Kubota K008-3	2,200	16"	1,200	No	1	\$ 24.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 700.00	\$ 2,100.00	
	11	Kubota KX040-4	10,200		4,080	Yes	2	\$ 35.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 1,180.00	\$ 3,540.00	
		Kubota KX040-4	9,600		4,080	Yes	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00	
	12	Kubota KX040-4	10,200		4,080	Yes	2	\$ 35.00	\$ 295.00	\$ 1,180.00	\$ 3,540.00	
	United Rentals Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour Notes Rates include 1 bucket	10	Takeuchi TB280	19,000	Variety		Yes	9		\$ 482.00	\$ 1,643.00	\$ 4,235.00
John Deere 130			25,000	Variety		Yes	5		\$ 663.26	\$ 1,755.27	\$ 4,436.94	
John Deere 135			35,000	Variety		Yes	13		\$ 735.60	\$ 2,053.24	\$ 5,087.04	
John Deere 160			40,000	Variety		Yes	6		\$ 735.60	\$ 2,053.24	\$ 5,087.04	
John Deere 225			55,000	Variety		Yes	14		\$ 966.00	\$ 2,901.00	\$ 7,422.00	
John Deere 350			70,000	Variety		Yes	3		\$ 1,488.45	\$ 4,003.54	\$ 10,015.36	
11		Takeuchi TB235	7,500					48		\$ 283.96	\$ 760.18	\$ 1,767.10
		Bobcat E45	10,000					30		\$ 321.83	\$ 916.84	\$ 2,104.85
		Takeuchi TB290	15,000					10		\$ 439.47	\$ 1,266.96	\$ 2,947.61

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 14 - Log Loader with Hydraulic Grapple

No Bid

Group 15 - Scraper

No Bid

Group 16 - Shoulder Spreader

No Bid

Group 17A - Broom, Regenerative Air Sweeper, Vacuum Truck Sweeper, & Self-Propelled Broom

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Laymor Sweeper, 8 ft</i>	N/A		\$ 540.00	\$ 1,490.00	\$ 4,625.00
Phone 360-734-5717						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$150 per hour						
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>CAT 903C2 Wheel Loader w/ Containment Broom</i>	1		\$ 370.00	\$ 1,480.00	\$ 4,440.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>CAT 259B or D Track Loader w/ Containment Broom</i>	2		\$ 340.00	\$ 1,360.00	\$ 4,000.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Bobcat S130 w/ Containment Broom</i>	1		\$ 265.00	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 3,000.00
Mobilization \$75 or \$110 per hour						
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>TYMCO 435</i>	1			\$ 1,700.00	\$ 5,100.00
Phone 206-762-5933	<i>TYMCO 600</i>	1			\$ 2,833.00	\$ 8,500.00
Location Kent						
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals	<i>Lay-Mor SM300</i>	30		\$ 276.30	\$ 813.81	\$ 1,835.80
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 17B - Broom, Side Cast with Cab

Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Broce 350</i>	1			\$ 907.00	\$ 2,720.00
Phone 206-762-5933 Location Kent Mobilization \$155 per hour						
United Rentals	<i>Broce RCT-350</i>	2		\$ 513.00	\$ 1,355.00	\$ 3,116.00
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18A - Steel Roller									
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Vibrate	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>BW 900</i>	2,639	35"	Yes	N/A		\$ 245.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 1,995.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>Bomag 47"</i>	5,732	47"	Yes	N/A		\$ 275.00	\$ 820.00	\$ 2,455.00
Location Bellingham									
Mobilization \$150 per hour									
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Dynapac CC1200</i>	5,692	47"	Yes	1		\$ 153.00	\$ 612.00	\$ 1,800.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>Vibromax 260</i>	5,940	47"	Yes	1		\$ 153.00	\$ 612.00	\$ 1,800.00
Location Bellingham									
Mobilization \$75 per hour									
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo DD30B</i>	7,164	49.2"	Yes	4			\$ 808.00	\$ 2,423.00
Phone 206-762-5933	<i>Volvo DD35B</i>	8,510	54.1"	Yes	3			\$ 1,020.00	\$ 3,060.00
Location Kent	<i>Volvo DD110C</i>	24,807	66.9"	Yes	2			\$ 1,558.00	\$ 4,675.00
Mobilization \$155 per hour									
United Rentals	<i>Wacker RD12A-90</i>	3,000	36"	Yes	25		\$ 225.20	\$ 612.00	\$ 1,589.00
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>Hamm H7I</i>	14,500	66"	Yes	10		\$ 478.91	\$ 1,313.90	\$ 3,129.51
Location Bellingham	<i>Hamm H10I</i>	22,675	84"	Yes	6		\$ 680.33	\$ 1,649.36	\$ 4,195.45
Mobilization \$125 per hour									

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18B - Pneumatic Roller								
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Bomag 66"</i>	15,355	66"	N/A		\$ 425.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 3,820.00
Phone 360-734-5717								
Location Bellingham								
Mobilization \$150 per hour								
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Vibromax 1105</i>	28,000	84"	2		\$ 310.00	\$ 1,240.00	\$ 3,720.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>Vibromax 605</i>	15,000	68"	2		\$ 230.00	\$ 920.00	\$ 2,760.00
Location Bellingham								
Mobilization \$110 per hour								
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo PT125</i>	25,000	68"	2			\$ 1,785.00	\$ 5,355.00
Phone 206-762-5933								
Location Kent								
Mobilization \$155 per hour								

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 18C - Sheepsfoot Roller								
Bidder Information	Description	Unit Weight	Roller Width	Units	Hourly	Daily	Wkly	Mnthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Bomag 33.5"</i>	3,495	33.5"	N/A		\$ 245.00	\$ 795.00	\$ 1,995.00
Phone 360-734-5717								
Location Bellingham								
Mobilization \$100 per hour								
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Vibromax 1105</i>	28,500	84"	1		\$ 350.00	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4,200.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>Vibromax 605</i>	15,500	68"	1		\$ 270.00	\$ 1,080.00	\$ 3,240.00
Location Bellingham								
Mobilization \$110 per hour								
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>Volvo SD115B</i>	27,600	84"	1			\$ 1,686.00	\$ 5,058.00
Phone 206-762-5933								
Location Kent								
Mobilization \$155 per hour								
United Rentals	<i>Hamm H7I</i>	14,500	66"	12		\$ 478.91	\$ 1,313.90	\$ 3,129.51
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>HammH10I</i>	22,675	84"	6		\$ 680.33	\$ 1,649.36	\$ 4,195.45
Location Bellingham								
Mobilization \$125 per hour								

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 19 - Mobile Crane							
Bidder Information	Description	Size in tons	Boom Length	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
United Rentals	<i>Manitex 1770C</i>	17	70-100'		\$ 678.14	\$ 1,834.49	\$ 4,573.84
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour							
Group 20 - Pile Driver							
No Bid							
Group 21 - Dragline or Clam							
No Bid							
Group 22 - Layton Box							
No Bid							
Group 23 - Pavement Pulverizer							
No Bid							
Group 24 - Self-Loading Ditch Cleaner							
No Bid							
Group 25 - Hydro-Seeder							
No Bid							

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 26 - Backhoe						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>310 John Deere</i>	N/A		\$ 210.00	\$ 1,045.00	\$ 2,483.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>580 Case</i>	N/A		\$ 310.00	\$ 1,090.00	\$ 2,745.00
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$150 per hour						
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Kubota B26 4x4</i>	1		\$ 165.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 1,800.00
Phone 360-676-9331						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$75 or \$110 per hour						
SE Rents LLC	<i>Kubota B26</i>	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 2,340.00
Phone 360-354-4071	<i>Kubota BX23SLB-R</i>	1	\$ 21.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 1,980.00
Location Lynden						
Mobilization \$85 per hour						
United Rentals	<i>Case 580N Ext-a-hoe</i>	24		\$ 310.34	\$ 838.93	\$ 1,930.46
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 27 - Tractor Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter							
Rotary/Rear Mount							
Bidder Information	Description	Reach Length	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Kubota B26</i>		1		\$ 165.00	\$ 660.00	\$ 1,800.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$75 or \$110 per hour							
SE Rents LLC	<i>Kubota B2650 & RCF2060</i>	5'	1	\$ 34.50	\$ 275.00	\$ 1,100.00	\$ 3,300.00
Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour							
Flail/Rear Mount							
No Bid							
Rotary/Shoulder							
No Bid							
Flail/Shoulder							
No Bid							
Rotary/Longarm							
No Bid							
Flail/Longarm							
Bidder Information	Description	Reach Length	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Kubota KX057-4 w/ 40" Flail</i>		1		\$ 382.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 4,400.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$75 or \$110 per hour							
SE Rents LLC	<i>Kubota MX4800 & RCF2072</i>	6'	1	\$ 38.75	\$ 310.00	\$ 1,240.00	\$ 3,720.00
Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 28 - Skid-Steer Mounted Mower & Brush Cutter							
Bidder Information	Description	Reach Length	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Cat 259 B orD Trackloader w/ 72" Brushcutter</i>		2		\$ 410.00	\$ 1,640.00	\$ 4,800.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$75 per hour							
SE Rents LLC	<i>Kubota SVL95 & AP-SC7072</i>	6'	1	\$ 90.00	\$ 650.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 7,800.00
Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour							

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 29 - Roadside Mower
No Bid

Group 30 - Walking Leg-Type Heavy Duty Brush Cutter
No Bid

Group 31 - Sewer Jet
No Bid

Group 32 - Water Truck						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
United Rentals	<i>2,000 Gallon Water Truck</i>	6		\$ 367.80	\$ 1,142.21	\$ 2,508.06
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>4,000 Gallon Water Truck</i>	5		\$ 605.79	\$ 1,723.36	\$ 4,046.38
Location Bellingham	<i>500 Gallon Water Trailer</i>	40		\$ 123.95	\$ 371.86	\$ 805.70
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Group 33 - Dust Retardant Truck
No Bid

Group 34 - Utility Boring Machine						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>3" Boring Tool</i>	N/A		\$ 250.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,150.00
Phone 360-734-5717						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$100 per hour						

Group 35 - Under Bridge Inspection Equipment
No Bid

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 36 - Snow Removal Equipment						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Cat 928G Wheel Loader 3yd w/ Enclosed Cab</i>	1		\$ 360.00	\$ 1,440.00	\$ 4,320.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>Cat 903C2 Wheel Loader 1yd w/ Enclosed Cab</i>	1		\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00	\$ 3,120.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Cat 259 B or D Track Loader w/ Enclosed Cab</i>	2		\$ 190.00	\$ 760.00	\$ 2,280.00
Mobilization \$75 or \$110 per hour						
SE Rents LLC	<i>Wheel Loader/Kubota R630</i>	1	\$ 30.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
Phone 360-354-4071	<i>Skid-Steer/Kubota SVL95</i>	1	\$ 45.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00
Location Lynden	<i>Skid-Steer/Kubota SVL75</i>	1	\$ 38.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,600.00
Mobilization \$85 per hour						
United Rentals	<i>See Skid Steers or Backhoes</i>					
Phone 360-647-7800						
Location Bellingham						
Mobilization \$125 per hour						

Group 37 - Man Lift						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>26' Scissor Genie</i>	N/A		\$ 110.00	\$ 320.00	\$ 795.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>45' Boom Lift Genie, 500 lb, 4WD</i>	N/A		\$ 260.00	\$ 825.00	\$ 2,380.00
Location Bellingham	<i>60' Boom Lift Genie, 500 lb, 4WD</i>	N/A		\$ 390.00	\$ 1,320.00	\$ 3,520.00
Mobilization \$150 per hour	<i>80' Boom Lift Genie, 500 lb, 4WD</i>	N/A		\$ 725.00	\$ 2,495.00	\$ 6,890.00
United Rentals	<i>Genie Z45 4WD Boom</i>	50		\$ 300.41	\$ 793.92	\$ 1,787.17
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>Genie S60 4WD Boom</i>	50		\$ 389.08	\$ 1,029.08	\$ 2,490.32
Location Bellingham	<i>Genie S80 4WD Boom</i>	25		\$ 720.53	\$ 1,800.83	\$ 4,069.04
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>Genie S125 4WD Boom</i>	25		\$ 1,301.09	\$ 3,511.43	\$ 8,229.19

Group 38 - Gas Powered Breaker-Rock Drill						
No Bid						

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 39 - Forklift						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>K-25 Komatsu, 5,000 lb</i>	N/A		\$ 150.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 1,190.00
Phone 360-734-5717	<i>519 Gehl Reach FL, 5,000 lb</i>	N/A		\$ 175.00	\$ 950.00	\$ 1,650.00
Location Bellingham	<i>842 Gehl Reach FL, 8,000 lb</i>	N/A		\$ 285.00	\$ 1,290.00	\$ 2,190.00
Mobilization \$150 per hour	<i>1155 Gehl Reach FL, 11,000 lb</i>	N/A		\$ 595.00	\$ 1,895.00	\$ 5,290.00
United Rentals	<i>5,000 lb Warehouse Forklift</i>	60		\$ 189.52	\$ 537.82	\$ 1,142.21
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>15,000 lb Warehouse Forklift</i>	8		\$ 435.38	\$ 1,240.61	\$ 2,787.31
Location Bellingham	<i>8,000 lb Reach Forklift 4WD</i>	60		\$ 399.98	\$ 1,080.06	\$ 2,499.90
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>Note - Please call for more options</i>					

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 40 - Trailer									
Bidder Information	Description	GVWR	Length	Hitch	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
Birch Equipment Rental & Sales	<i>Tilt</i>	14,000	20'	2-5/16"	N/A		\$ 85.00	\$ 270.00	\$ 695.00
Phone 360-734-5717 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$120 per hour									
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Tilt</i>	5,000	12'6"	pintle	2		\$ 35.00	\$ 140.00	\$ 420.00
Phone 360-676-9331 Location Bellingham Mobilization									
SE Rents LLC	<i>Tilt</i>	14,000	20'	2-5/16"	1	\$ 22.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 340.00	\$ 1,020.00
Phone 360-354-4071 Location Lynden Mobilization \$85 per hour									
United Rentals	<i>Tilt</i>	10,000	18'	2-5/16"	20		\$ 75.36	\$ 230.50	\$ 527.47
Phone 360-647-7800 Location Bellingham Mobilization \$125 per hour									

Whatcom County Bid #19-15
Rental Rates for Equipment Without Operator

Group 41 - Miscellaneous Equipment						
Bidder Information	Description	Units	Hourly	Daily	Weekly	Monthly
NW Heavy Equipment Repair	<i>Vermeer BC1000XL 10" Chipper</i>	1		\$ 225.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 2,500.00
Phone 360-676-9331	<i>Wacker 800lb Reversible Plate Diesel Electric Start</i>	1		\$ 128.00	\$ 512.00	\$ 1,536.00
Location Bellingham	<i>Wacker VP1340 Plate Compactor w/ Water Tank</i>	1		\$ 48.00	\$ 192.00	\$ 576.00
Mobilization \$75 per hour	<i>Vibromax 128lb Jumping Jack</i>	1		\$ 63.00	\$ 252.00	\$ 756.00
	<i>Vermeer S450TX Compact Track Loader, "Dingostyle", 36" Wide</i>	1		\$ 160.00	\$ 640.00	\$ 1,920.00
	<i>Vermeer SC30TX Stump Grinder, 35" Wide, w/ Trailer, 25hp, Gas</i>	1		\$ 220.00	\$ 880.00	\$ 2,640.00
PacWest Machinery, LLC	<i>RoadTec SB-2500 Shuttle Buggy</i>	3				\$ 30,000.00
Phone 206-762-5933	<i>RoadTec RX-300 Cold Planer</i>	4				\$ 22,000.00
Location Kent	<i>RoadTec RX-600 Cold Planer</i>					\$ 28,000.00
Mobilization \$155 per hour						
SE Rents LLC	<i>Flail Mower/US Mower EX30 (Fits the KX040/121)</i>	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 260.00	\$ 1,040.00	\$ 3,120.00
Phone 360-354-4071	<i>Flail Mower/US Mower EX40 (Fits the KX057/KX080)</i>	1	\$ 38.00	\$ 280.00	\$ 1,120.00	\$ 3,360.00
Location Lynden	<i>Breaker/Kubota KXB510 (Fits the KX040/121)</i>	1	\$ 28.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 740.00	\$ 2,220.00
Mobilization \$85 per hour	<i>Breaker/Kubota KXB560 (Fits the KX057)</i>	1	\$ 28.00	\$ 195.00	\$ 780.00	\$ 2,340.00
	<i>Hoepak/Stanley HS3125 (Fits the KX040/KX057/KX080)</i>	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,800.00
	<i>Skid-Steer/Kubota SSV65</i>	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 800.00	\$ 2,400.00
	<i>Skid-Steer/Kubota SVL75</i>	1	\$ 38.00	\$ 300.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 3,600.00
	<i>Skid-Steer/Kubota SVL95</i>	1	\$ 45.00	\$ 325.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 3,900.00
	<i>Breaker/Stanley MB05S02 (Fits the SSV65 Skid-Steer)</i>	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,800.00
	<i>Brush Rake/Bluestar/48/040 (Fits the KX040/121)</i>	1	\$ 8.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 600.00
	<i>Post Pounder/PDX750 (Fits the KX040/121)</i>	1	\$ 24.00	\$ 185.00	\$ 740.00	\$ 2,220.00
United Rentals	<i>Light Tower - Towable</i>	100		\$ 99.47	\$ 241.13	\$ 528.72
Phone 360-647-7800	<i>185cfm Compressor - Towable</i>	100		\$ 105.50	\$ 266.25	\$ 637.99
Location Bellingham	<i>Track Skid Steer - Bobcat T550</i>	25		\$ 305.55	\$ 920.98	\$ 2,031.57
Mobilization \$125 per hour	<i>Message Board - Solar/Towable</i>	25		\$ 266.25	\$ 627.94	\$ 1,120.64
	<i>Arrow Board - Solar/Towable</i>	15		\$ 95.74	\$ 276.30	\$ 568.84
	<i>25kva Generator - Towable</i>	45		\$ 211.29	\$ 536.34	\$ 1,181.02
	<i>Rammer/Jumping Jack</i>	35		\$ 91.95	\$ 271.47	\$ 578.79
	<i>Plate Compactor (std)</i>	40		\$ 88.85	\$ 238.37	\$ 563.42
	<i>2" submersible pump</i>	40		\$ 52.74	\$ 130.15	\$ 325.37
<i>Note - Please call for additional items</i>						